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1. ABINGDON ELEMENTARY
Unit - Each Month
Unit Price $65.00 $95.00
Emergency Price $65.00 $350.00
2. ARLINGTON SCIENCE FOCUS ELEMENTARY N
Unit - Each Month o :
Unit Price $65.00, $95.00
Emergency Price $65.00 $0.00|
3. ARLINGTON TRADITIONAL ELEMENTARY
Unit - Each Month
Unit Price ~ $65.00 $95.00
Emergency Price $65.00 $0.00
4. ASHLAWN ELEMENTARY B
Unit - Each Month
Unit Price $65.00 $95.00
Emergency Price $65.00 $0.00
5. BARCROFT ELEMENTARY
Unit - Each Month : N
Unit Price $65.00 $95.00
Emergency Price $65.00 $0.00
6. BARRETT ELEMENTARY
Unit - Each Month
Unit Price $65.00 $95.00
Emergency Price $65.00 $0.00
7. CAMPBELL ELEMENTARY
Unit - Each Month
Unit Price $65.00 $95.00
Emergency Price _ $65.00 $0.00
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8. CAREER CENTER

Unit - Each Month

Unit Price $125.00 $190.00
Emergency Price $65.00 $0.00
9. CARLIN SPRINGS ELEMENTARY

Unit - Each Month

Unit Price $65.00 $95.00
Emergency Price $65.00 $0.00
10. CLAREMONT ELEMENTARY

Unit - Each Month

Unit Price $65.00 $95.00
Emergency Price $65.00 $0.00
[11. DREW ELEMENTARY

Unit - Each Month

Unit Price $65.00 $95.00
| Emergency Price $65.00 $350.00
12. EDUCATION CENTER

Unit - Each Month

Unit Price $65.00 $95.00
Emergency Price $65.00 $0.00
13. FACILITIES & OPERATIONS

Unit - Each Month

Unit Price $65.00 $95.00
Emergency Price $65.00 $0.00
14. GLEBE ELEMENTARY

Unit - Each Month

Unit Price $65.00 $95.00
Emergency Price $65.00 $0.00
15. GUNSTON MIDDLE SCHOOL

Unit - Each Month |
Unit Price $125.00 $190.00
Emergency Price $65.00 $0.00
16. H-B WOODLAWN SECONDARY

Unit - Each Month ]
Unit Price $125.00 $285.00]
Emergency Price $65.00 $0.00
17. HENRY ELEMENTARY

Unit - Each Month

Unit Price $65.00 $95.00
Emergency Price $65.00 $0.00
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18. HOFFMAN BOSTON ELEMENTARY
|Unit - Each Month

Unit Price _ $65.00 $95.00
Emergency Price $65.00 $0.00

19. JAMESTOWN ELEMENTARY
Unit - Each Month |
Unit Price | $65.00| $95.00
Emergency Price $65.00 $350.00

20. JEFFERSON MIDDLE SCHOOL
Unit - Each Month :
Unit Price $125.00 $190.00

Emergency Price $65.00 $350.00

21. KENMORE MIDDLE SCHOOL
Unit - Each Month ]
Unit Price $125.00]  $190.00
Emergency Price $65.00 $0.00

22. KEY ELEMENTARY
Unit - Each Month 1 )
Unit Price : $65.00 $95.00
Emergency Price $65.00 $0.00

23. LANGSTON H. S. CONTINUATION _
Unit - Each Month

Unit Price \ _ $65.00 $95.00
Emergency Price $65.00 $0.00

24. L ONG BRANCH ELEMENTARY
Unit - Each Month

Unit Price $65.00 $95.00
Emergency Price $65.00 $0.00

25. THURGOOD MARSHALL BUILDING
Unit - Each Month

Unit Price $65.00 $95.00
Emergency Price $65.00 $0.00;

26. McKINLEY ELEMENTARY
Unit - Each Month :
Unit Price , . $65.00 $95.00|
Emergency Price $65.00 $0.00

27. NOTTINGHAM ELEMENTARY
Unit - Each Month |
Unit Price $65.000  $95.00
Emergency Price ' $65.00 $0.00
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28. OAKRIDGE ELEMENTARY

Unit - Each Month

| Unit Price $65.00 $95.00
Emergency Price $65.00 $0.00
29. RANDOLPH ELEMENTARY

Unit - Each Month |
Unit Price $65.00 $95.00
|[Emergency Price $65.00 $0.00
30. REED SCHOOL / FAMILY ED. CENTER

Unit - Each Month

Unit Price $65.00/ $95.00
Emergency Price $65.00 $0.00

31. STRATFORD PROGRAM

Unit - Each Month

To be Priced with H-B Woodlawn (ltem 16)

32. SWANSON MIDDLE SCHOOL

Unit - Each Month

$125.00

Unit Price $190.00
[Emergency Price $65.00 $0.00
33. TAYLOR ELEMENTARY

Unit - Each Month _ :

Unit Price $65.00 $190.00
Emergency Price $65.00 $0.00
34. TUCKAHOE ELEMENTARY

Unit - Each Month :

Unit Price $65.00 $190.00
Emergency Price $65.00 $0.00
35. WAKEFIELD HIGH SCHOOL

Unit - Each Month )
Unit Price $125.00 $285.00
Emergency Price $65.00 $0.00

36. WAKEFIELD SWIMMING POOL

Unit - Each Month

To be Priced with Wakefield H.S.

37. WASHINGTON LEE HIGH SCHOOL

Unit - Each Month

Unit Price

$125.00

$190.00

Emergency Price

$65.00

$350.00
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38. WILLAMSBURG MIDDLE SCHOOL

Unit - Each Month

Unit Price $125.00 $190.00
Emergency Price $65.00 $0.00
39. WILSON BUILDING
Unit - Each Month
Unit Price $65.00 $95.00)
Emergency Price $65.00 $0.00
40. YORKTOWN HIGH SCHOOL ]
Unit - Each Month
Unit Price $125.00 $190.00
Emergency Price $65.00 $0.00
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PART # 1
TOTAL MONTHY COST FOR ITEMS 1 - 40 $3,070.00 $4,940.00
TOTAL EMERGENCY COST FOR ITEMS 1, 11, 19, 20 & 37 $325.00 $1,750.00
TECHNICIAN HOURLY RATE FOR BED BUG & TERMITE TREATMENT ]
Unit - Each Hour
Unit Price $65.00 $95.00
4 Hours of Regular Time $260.00 $380.00
TECHNICIAN OVER TIME RATE FOR BED BUG & TERMITE TREATMENT
Unit - Each Hour B
Unit Price $65.00 $150.00
2 Hours of Over Time $130.00 $300.00
TOTAL FOR PART 1 $3,785.00]  $7,370.00|
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ARLINGTON PUBLIC SCHOOLS
PRICING SCHEDULE
INVITATION FOR BID # 33FY13

TITLE: PEST CONTROL SERVICES

DATE: FEBRUARY 21,2013 TIME: 2:00 PM

ALL AMERICAN PEST CONTROL, INC.
5613 LEESBURG PIKE # 12

WESTERN PEST SERVICES

10843 MAIN STREET

{FALLS CHURCH, VA. 22041
FAIRFAX, VA. 22030

PART #2

TECHNICIAN HOURLY RATE FOR ORNAMENTAL/AQUATIC/TERMITE
TREATMENT

Unit - Each Hour

Unit Price $65.00 No Bid

4 Hours Regular Time $260.00 No Bid

TECHNICIAN OVERTIME RATE FOR ORNAMENTAL/AQUATICITERMITE
TREATMENT

Unit - Each Hour 3

Unit Price ) | $65.00 NoBid

2 Hours of Overtime Time $130.00 No Bid

TOTAL FOR PART # 2 ORNAMENTAL/AQUATIC/TERMITE TREATMENT $390.00 No Bid

PART # 3

TECHNICIAN HOURLY RATE FOR CATEGORY 8 PUBLIC HEALTH PEST
TREATMENT

Unit - Each Hour

Unit Price "~ $65.00 No Bid

4 Hours of Regular Time . $260.00 NoBid

TECHNICIAN OVER TIME RATE FOR CATEGORY 8 PUBLIC HEALTH PEST
TREATMENT

Unit - Each Hour

Unit Price ‘ : $65.00: No Bid

2 Hours of Overtime Time $130.00, NoBid

TOTAL FOR PART 3 PUBLIC HEALTH PEST TREATMENT $390.00 No Bid




